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Letter to the Editor 

Preventing aortic dissection in Turner syndrome: Who faces the risk?1  
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As a group that participated in the creation of the international 
Turner syndrome guidelines [1], we are concerned that the article by 
Thunstrom et al. “Aortic size predicts aortic dissection in Turner syndrome – 
A 25-year prospective cohort study” [2] reports a high (~ 80%) false- 
positive dissection rate. The article proposes small echo-determined 
aortic diameter surgical thresholds to prevent aortic dissection: an ab
solute ascending aortic diameter of 3.3 cm or Turner syndrome-specific 
Z-score of 2.1 (normal<2) [3]. The international guidelines endorse 
larger ascending aorta thresholds for surgery: > 4 cm and TS-specific Z- 
scores ≥4. The consequences of assigning high-risk to individuals with 
near normal aortic diameters are significant because they would expose 
numerous people (~ 80%) who are unlikely to dissect to major thoracic 
surgery, unnecessary physical activity restrictions, and fear of attempt
ing pregnancy. The reason Thunstrom’s results differ markedly from 
prior studies may be that only 4 of 12 echocardiograms were performed 
within one year before dissection. In the others, aneurysm growth may 
have accelerated during the intervening years. Also, the international 
guideline specifies ascending aorta interrogation at the level of the right 
pulmonary artery to insure consistency. Thunstrom states only that a 
“proximal portion” of the ascending aorta was measured. Variable di
ameters along the length of the proximal ascending aorta may have 
lowered the mean value. The international guidelines are useful but 
have limitations as they are based on expert opinion, meta-analyses, and 
registry data. Studies employing CT/MRI imaging and consideration of 
co-morbidities (age, BAV, coarctation, blood pressure) are necessary 
[4]. 
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